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(5.95 MB). and IL-6, possibly driving
hASCs to senescence and
exhaustion.\[[@ref15][@ref50]\] Under
these scenarios, cell-based regenerative
therapies have no direct impact on skeletal
muscle tissue. The transfer of hASCs to
muscle and integration into the tissue may
improve muscle function. **The clinical
translation of all these trends** A lot of
challenges remain in human and large
animal studies, which are precisely the
sources of uncertainties about the
translation of this research to clinical
therapy. As we have already outlined, the
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use of the term "cell therapy" must be
carefully interpreted. In his report, *Cell
Therapy* (2017) published a schematic
representation of the different criteria to
define the term "cell therapy" in the title of
the article (p. 6). Probably the authors
chose to move away from the term "stem
cell therapy" in order to clearly establish
the concept, as previously proposed by
Scuderi and Serori.\[[@ref10]\] Thus, "cell
therapy" should not be considered as a
synonym for "stem cell therapy," but it is a
broad term that highlights the beneficial
role of cells in disease diagnosis,
treatment, and rehabilitation. In this sense,
a subgroup of the "biotech" or "cell"
sectors became subject to the development
of laboratory-ready product, and in the
past few years the industry acknowledged
the need to define the meaning of "cell
therapy" in the title, either as a synonym
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for "stem cell therapy" or as a product that
could be defined as a "cell therapy" and
moreover is compatible with the regulatory
framework of the products. The first
clinical trial using hESCs (Pituitary
Adenoma) was recently
published,\[[@ref51]\] with expected
indications in the coming future.
Regarding drug delivery, the strategy of
the injection of the cells into the proximity
of the damaged tissue,\[[@ref52]\] appears
to be the most important, not only due to
the massive improvement of
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computer.Trial to start for Aboucassol
Judge Jessica Recuenco on February 6

(Ricardo Rodriguez/Reuters) A trial began
on February 6 to examine alleged police

torture in Tindavan prison in Algeria
during the weeks surrounding the January
31 presidential election. Laurent Fabius, a

lawyer acting on behalf of the victim,
Aboucassol, and five other detainees, is

contending that they were beaten by police
before and after they were taken to the

prison, according to Le Nouvel
Observateur magazine. During the trial,
evidence was submitted that one of the

accused is Aboucassol’s brother, who is in
the police. It was also confirmed that the
trial was initiated by the victim himself,

upon being released from Tindavan,
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although he was never given the
opportunity to do so. Meanwhile the

Algerian senate’s defense committee has
approved a request from Defense Minister
Ahmed Abdelaziz to raise the amount of

the national defense budget from 545
billion dinars to 568 billion dinars. The

increase is “necessary to meet the country’s
commitments in the period from January 1

to June 30, 2016,” notes the state-run
National Algerian Press Service. The
government has until December 15 to

approve the 2011 budget. “The increase
will take the defense budget to 550 billion

dinars,” the security official
added.[Epidemiological, clinical and
therapeutic aspects of Burkholderia

cepacia infections]. Burkholderia cepacia
is a Gram-negative bacillus, which is

commonly isolated in the environment,
particularly in soils and plants. It produces
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nosocomial infections, particularly in
patients with cystic fibrosis (CF) and in the
intensive care unit. The two most common

presentations are lung infection and
systemic infection. In CF patients, B.

cepacia affects the small airways, leading
to bronchiectasis, and it spreads via the

airways to the respiratory and circ
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